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The most significant risk factor for the development of cardiovascular disease is thought 
to be hypertension. One of the key factors behind the emergence of hypertension, 
oxidative stress, has attracted attention. Reactive oxygen species (ROS) may play a part in 
the mechanism underlying hypertension because they are crucial to maintaining the 
vascular wall's equilibrium. Additionally, mechanical forces that rise with hypertension 
may contribute to increased ROS generation. Increased intracellular calcium 
concentration causes ROS-induced vasoconstriction, which contributes to the 
development of hypertension. Vasomotor tone depends on a precise balance between 
vasoconstrictor and vasodilator forces that are produced by the interaction of the blood 
and vascular wall components. Oxidative stress can change any of these forces. These 
results have sparked interest in antihypertensive treatments that aim to reduce ROS 
production and/or boost nitric oxide (NO) bioavailability.
A strong water-soluble antioxidant, Vitamin C acts as an enzyme modulator on the arterial 
wall, increasing endothelial nitric oxide synthase (eNOS) and decreasing NADPH 
oxidase (NOX). Antioxidant therapy has been proven to improve vascular function and 
lower blood pressure in both animal models of hypertension and human hypertension [1, 
2]. Vascular dilatation may benefit from vitamin C, probably due to its antioxidant effects 
on NO.
Another important lipid-soluble antioxidant, Vitamin E, has drawn a lot of interest due to 
its antioxidant properties. A high dietary vitamin E intake is associated with a lower 
incidence of cardiovascular disease and a growing body of research suggests that vitamin 
E can modify biological processes without affecting its antioxidant capacity. The existing 
experimental data demonstrates that vitamin E is capable of dose-dependently controlling 
the production of superoxide and hydrogen peroxide in the mitochondria which in turn 
shows anti-hypertensive effects [3].
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